APPROVED 01/06/2012

From: Kristine Johnston
Director of Purchasing

Date: January 6, 2012

Re: Career and Technology Equipment Repair Service
Annual Contract #11-12-2787R-IB

The following bids were received and opened at 2:00 p.m., Friday, December 16, 2011, as advertised and
specified in documents concerning Annual Contract #11-12-2787R-IB for Career and Technology
Equipment Repair Service. The bids received are located on pages 2-18.

% No award.

Recommendation: . . o
Award contracts to each of the vendors listed at the discount or pricing noted.

American Industrial Supply

Circle Saw

Conroe Welding Supply, Inc.

MTF Equipment Sales

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Sewing & Vacuum Warehouse
Teaching Systems, Inc.

Funding: M & O Funds, Activity Funds

Estimated Expenditure: $45,000.00

pcC



APPROVED 01/06/2012
Career and Technology Equipment Repair Service, Annual Contract #11-12-2787R-IB, Page 2 of 18

Line Items

alLine 1 Hourly Rate for On-site per alignment industrial computerized equipment repair.
Name QTY UOM  Price
MTF Equipment Sales 1 Hour No Bid
American Industrial Supply 1 Hour No Bid
Conroe Welding Supply, Inc. 1 Hour No Bid
Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Hour No Bid
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Hour No Bid
Circle Saw 1 Hour No Bid

alLine 2 Hourly Rate for In-shop per alignment industrial computerized equipment repair.
Name QTY UOM  Price
American Industrial Supply 1 Hour No Bid
Conroe Welding Supply, Inc. 1 Hour No Bid
Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Hour No Bid
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Hour No Bid
Circle Saw 1 Hour No Bid

4Line 3 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY UOM  Price
MTF Equipment Sales 1 Each No Bid
American Industrial Supply 1 Each No Bid
Conroe Welding Supply, Inc. 1 Each No Bid
Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Each No Bid
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each No Bid
Circle Saw 1 Each No Bid

#Line 4 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY UOM  Price
MTF Equipment Sales 1 Each No Bid
American Industrial Supply 1 Each No Bid
Conroe Welding Supply, Inc. 1 Each No Bid
Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Each No Bid
Circle Saw 1 Each No Bid

¥Line 5 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTY UOM  Price
MTF Equipment Sales 1 Each No Bid
American Industrial Supply 1 Each No Bid
Conroe Welding Supply, Inc. 1 Each No Bid
Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Each No Bid
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each No Bid
Circle Saw 1 Each No Bid

#Line 6 Travel time per hour (if any)
Name QTY UOM  Price
MTF Equipment Sales 1 Hour No Bid
American Industrial Supply 1 Hour No Bid
Conroe Welding Supply, Inc. 1 Hour No Bid
Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Hour No Bid
Circle Saw 1 Hour No Bid

ALine 7 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY UOM  Price
MTF Equipment Sales 1 Mile No Bid
American Industrial Supply 1 Mile No Bid
Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Mile No Bid
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Mile No Bid
Circle Saw 1 Mile No Bid

#Line 8 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY UuomM Percent Off
MTF Equipment Sales 1 Percentage No Bid
American Industrial Supply 1 Percentage No Bid
Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Percentage No Bid
Circle Saw 1 Percentage No Bid
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Line Items
|Line 9 Hourly Rate for On-site per automotive 2 post lift equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Hour $50.00
1 Hour $90.00

[Line 10

Hourly Rate for In-shop per automotive 2 post lift equipment repair.

Name
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

Hour $50.00
Hour $90.00

QTY UoM Price
1
1

Line 11 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)

Name QTY UOM  Price

American Industrial Supply 1 Each No Bid

Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Each No Bid

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each No Bid

Circle Saw 1 Each No Bid

[Line 12 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY UOM  Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each $25.00

MTF Equipment Sales 1 Each $90.00

[Line 13 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTY UOM Price

MTE Equipment Sales

1 Each $0.00

ine ravel time per hour (if any
Line 14 T | ti h if
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTE Equipment Sales

1 Hour $25.00
1 Hour $75.00

[Line 15 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY UOM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTE Equipment Sales

1 Mile $0.50
1 Mile $1.00

[Line 16 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY UOM Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTE Equipment Sales

1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 0%

#Line 17

Hourly Rate for On-site per engine diagnostic equipment repair.

Name

MTF Equipment Sales

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

uUomMm  Price

Hour No Bid
Hour No Bid
Hour No Bid
Hour No Bid

.-'.-'.-'.-‘9
-<

¥Line 18

Hourly Rate for In-shop per engine diagnostic equipment repair.

Name
American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc

uom Price
Hour No Bid
Hour No Bid

el
<

#Line 19

Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)

Name

MTF Equipment Sales

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

uUomMm  Price

Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid

.-'.-'.-'.-.-‘9
-<

#Line 20 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY UOM Price

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Each No Bid
1 Each No Bid
1 Each No Bid
1 Each No Bid
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Line Items
Line 21 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTY UOM Price

MTF Equipment Sales

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid

PR R PR

#Line 22

Travel time per hour (if any)

Name

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

UomM  Price

Hour No Bid
Hour No Bid
Hour No Bid
Hour No Bid

»—\»—-»—-»—\‘9
-<

#Line 23 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY UOM Price

MTF Equipment Sales

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Mile No Bid
1 Mile No Bid
1 Mile No Bid
1 Mile No Bid
1 Mile No Bid

#Line 24 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Percentage No Bid
Percentage No Bid
Percentage No Bid
Percentage No Bid

i

|Line 25 Hourly Rate for On-site per tire changer equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

Hour $50.00
Hour $85.00

1
1

[Line 26

Hourly Rate for In-shop per tire changer equipment repair.

Name
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

UoM Price
Hour $50.00

-8
<

[Line 27

Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)

Name
MTFE Equipment Sales

QTY UoM Price
1 Each $85.00

[Line 28

Mininum charge per repair (if any)

Name
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

QTY UoM Price
1 Each $25.00

|Line 29 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Each $0.00

|Line 30 Travel time per hour (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Hour $25.00

|Line 31 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Mile $0.50
1 Mile $1.00

|Line 32 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 0%

|Line 33 Hourly Rate for On-site per wheel balancer (heavy duty) equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Hour $50.00
1 Hour $85.00
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Line Items
|Line 34 Hourly Rate for In-shop per wheel balancer (heavy duty) equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $50.00

MTFE Equipment Sales 1 Hour $85.00

|Line 35 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY UoM Price

MTFE Equipment Sales 1 Each $85.00

|Line 36 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY UoM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each $25.00

MTFE Equipment Sales 1 Each $85.00

|Line 37 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTY UoM Price

MTFE Equipment Sales 1 Each $0.00

|Line 38 Travel time per hour (if any)

Name QTY UoM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Hour $25.00
1 Hour $85.00

|Line 39 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Mile $0.50
|Line 40 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY UoM Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 0%

|Line 41 Hourly Rate for On-site per hand operated bender equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $50.00

|Line 42 Hourly Rate for In-shop per hand operated bender equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $50.00

Line 43 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY UOM Price

MTF Equipment Sales 1 Each No Bid
American Industrial Supply 1 Each No Bid
Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Each No Bid

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each No Bid

[Line 44 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY UOM  Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each $25.00

a|Line 45 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTy  UOM  Price
MTF Equipment Sales 1 Each No Bid
American Industrial Supply 1 Each No Bid
Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Each No Bid
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each No Bid

|Line 46 Travel time per hour (if any)
Name

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

QTY UoM Price
1 Hour $25.00

|Line 47 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Mile $0.50

|Line 48 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Percentage 10%

APPROVED 01/06/2012
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Line Items
|Line 49 Hourly Rate for On-site per brake, box pan (finger brake) equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $50.00

|Line 50 Hourly Rate for In-shop per brake, box pan (finger brake) equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $50.00

#Line 51 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)

Name QTY UOM  Price

MTF Equipment Sales 1 Each No Bid

American Industrial Supply 1 Each No Bid

Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Each No Bid

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each No Bid

[Line 52 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY UOM  Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each $25.00

a|Line 53

Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)

Name

MTF Equipment Sales

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

UomMm  Price

Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid

»—\»—-b—-»—\‘c—q;'
-<

[Line 54

Travel time per hour (if any)

Name
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

QTY UoM Price
1 Hour $25.00

|Line 55 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Mile $0.50

|Line 56 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Percentage 10%

|Line 57 Hourly Rate for On-site per drill press equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $50.00

|Line 58 Hourly Rate for In-shop per drill press equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $50.00

#Line 59 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY UOM Price

MTF Equipment Sales

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid

PR R e

[Line 60 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each $25.00

[Line 61 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Circle Saw 1 Each $75.00

[Line 62 Travel time per hour (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Hour $25.00
1 Hour $95.00

[Line 63 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY UOM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Mile $0.50
1 Mile $0.00
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Line Items
|Line 64 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 0%

|Line 65 Hourly Rate for On-site per injection molder equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $50.00

|Line 66 Hourly Rate for In-shop per injection molder equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $50.00

Line 67 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY UOM Price

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Each No Bid
1 Each No Bid
1 Each No Bid

[Line 68 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY uom Price
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each $25.00

a|Line 69 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name UoM Price

MTF Equipment Sales

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid

»—\»—-b—-»—\‘c—q;'
-<

[Line 70

Travel time per hour (if any)

Name
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

QTY UoM Price
1 Hour $25.00

|Line 71 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Mile $0.50

|Line 72 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Percentage 10%

[Line 73 Hourly Rate for On-site per iron worker, hydraulic equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTF Equipment Sales

1 Hour $50.00
1 Hour $85.00

[Line 74 Hourly Rate for In-shop per iron worker, hydraulic equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Hour $50.00
1 Hour $85.00

|Line 75 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Each $85.00

|Line 76 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Each $25.00
1 Each $85.00

Line 77 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTY UOM Price

MTF Equipment Sales

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid

PR R PR
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Line Items
|Line 78 Travel time per hour (if any)
Name QTY UoM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Hour $25.00
1 Hour $85.00

|Line 79 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Mile $0.50
1 Mile $1.00

|Line 80 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 0%

|Line 81 Hourly Rate for On-site per jointer, 6 in. and 8 in. equipment repair.
Name QTY UoM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Hour $50.00

Circle Saw 1 Hour $95.00

|Line 82 Hourly Rate for In-shop per jointer, 6 in. and 8 in. equipment repair.
Name QTY UoM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Hour $50.00

Circle Saw 1 Hour $75.00

|Line 83 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)

Name QTY UoM Price

Circle Saw 1 Each $0.00

|Line 84 Mininum charge per repair (if any)

Name QTY UoM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each $25.00

Circle Saw 1 Each $0.00

|Line 85 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)

Name QTY UoM Price

Circle Saw 1 Each $75.00

|Line 86 Travel time per hour (if any)

Name QTY UoM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Hour $25.00

Circle Saw 1 Hour $95.00

|Line 87 Mileage charge (if any)

Name QTY UoM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Mile $0.50

Circle Saw 1 Mile $0.00

|Line 88 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY UoM Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Percentage 10%

Circle Saw 1 Percentage 0%

|Line 89 Hourly Rate for On-site per Metal 10 in., mini-tabletop, wood lathe equipment repair.
Name QTY UoM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $50.00

|Line 90 Hourly Rate for Metal In-shop per 10 in., mini-tabletop, wood lathe equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $50.00

|Line 91 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY UoM Price

Circle Saw 1 Each $95.00

|Line 92 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY UoM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each $25.00

Circle Saw 1 Each $95.00

|Line 93 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)

Name QTY UoM Price

Circle Saw

1 Each $95.00
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Line Items
|Line 94 Travel time per hour (if any)
Name QTY UoM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Hour
1 Hour

$25.00
$95.00

|Line 95 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Mile $0.50
1 Mile

|Line 96 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 0%

|Line 97 Hourly Rate for On-site per CNC Hurco lathe equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $50.00

|Line 98 Hourly Rate for In-shop per CNC Hurco lathe equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $50.00

#Line 99 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY UOM  Price
American Industrial Supply 1 Each No Bid
Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Each No Bid
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each No Bid
Circle Saw 1 Each No Bid

[Line 100 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY UOM  Price
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each $25.00

a|Line 101 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name UOM  Price

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid

»—\»—-»—-‘9
<

[Line 102

Travel time per hour (if any)

Name
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

QTY UoM Price
1 Hour $25.00

|Line 103 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Mile $0.50

|Line 104 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Percentage 10%

[Line 105 Hourly Rate for On-site per mill, vertical, manual equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $50.00

[Line 106 Hourly Rate for In-shop per mill, vertical manual equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $50.00

?[Line 107 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY UOM Price

MTF Equipment Sales

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid

PR R PR



Career and Technology Equipment Repair Service, Annual Contract #11-12-2787R-IB, Page 10 of 18

APPROVED 01/06/2012

Line Items

|Line 108 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY UOM  Price
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each $25.00

#Line 109 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTY UOM  Price

MTF Equipment Sales 1 Each No Bid
American Industrial Supply 1 Each No Bid
Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Each No Bid
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each No Bid
Circle Saw 1 Each No Bid
[Line 110 Travel time per hour (if any)
Name QTY UOM  Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $25.00

[Line 111 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY UOM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Mile $0.50

[Line 112 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY UOM Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Percentage 10%

[Line 113 Hourly Rate for On-site per mill, vertical, CNC equipment repair.
Name QTY UOM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Hour $50.00
1 Hour $85.00

[Line 114 Hourly Rate for In-shop per mill, vertical CNC equipment repair.
Name QTY UOM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Hour $50.00
1 Hour $85.00

#Line 115

Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)

Name

MTF Equipment Sales

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid

QTY UomMm  Price
1
1
1
1 Each No Bid
1

Circle Saw Each No Bid
|Line 116 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

QTY UoM Price
1 Each $25.00

#Line 117

Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)

Name

MTF Equipment Sales

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid

QTY UOM  Price
1
1
1
1 Each No Bid
1

Circle Saw Each No Bid
[Line 118 Travel time per hour (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Hour $25.00
1 Hour $85.00

[Line 119 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY UOM Price

Teaching Systems, Inc
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Mile $0.45
1 Mile $0.50

[Line 120 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY UOM Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 0%
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Line Items
|Line 121 Hourly Rate for On-site per planer, 18 in. and 20 in. equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Hour $50.00
Hour $95.00

[y

[Line 122

Hourly Rate for In-shop per planer, 18 in. and 20 in. equipment repair.

Name
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

UoM Price
Hour $50.00
Hour $75.00

HPAB
-<

|Line 123 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Circle Saw 1 Each $95.00

|Line 124 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

Each $25.00
Each $95.00

HPAB
-<

ine ick-up elivery charge (if any
Line 125 Pick: & deli h if
Name QTY UoM Price

Circle Saw 1 Each $95.00

ine ravel time per hour (if any

Line 126 T | ti h if

ame Q rice

N TY UuoMm Pri

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Hour $25.00
1 Hour $95.00

|Line 127 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Mile $0.50
1 Mile $0.00

|Line 128 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 0%

|Line 129 Hourly Rate for On-site per belt sander 6 in. and 12 in., orbital, spindle equipment
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Hour $50.00
1 Hour $95.00

|Line 130 Hourly Rate for In-shop per belt sander 6 in. and 12 in., orbital, spindle equipment
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Hour $50.00
1 Hour $75.00

|Line 131 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Circle Saw 1 Each $95.00

|Line 132 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

Each $25.00
Each $95.00

»—-»—-‘9
-<

|Line 133 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price
Circle Saw 1 Each $95.00
|Line 134 Travel time per hour (if any)
Name TY uom Price

QTY

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Hour $25.00

|Line 135 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Mile $0.50
1 Mile $0.00

|Line 136 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 0%
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|Line 137 Hourly Rate for On-site saw equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Hour $50.00
Hour $95.00

[y

[Line 138

Hourly Rate for In-shop saw equipment repair.

Name
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

UoM Price
Hour $50.00
Hour $75.00

»—-»—-‘9
-<

|Line 139 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Circle Saw 1 Each $95.00

|Line 140 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

Each $25.00
Each $95.00

»—-»—-‘9
-<

|Line 141 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price
Circle Saw 1 Each $95.00
|Line 142 Travel time per hour (if any)
Name TY uom Price

QTY

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Hour $25.00

|Line 143 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Mile $0.50
1 Mile $0.00

|Line 144 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 0%

|Line 145 Hourly Rate for On-site per shear, foot squaring equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $50.00

|Line 146 Hourly Rate for In-shop per shear, foot squaring equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $50.00

#Line 147 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY UOM Price

MTF Equipment Sales

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid

PR R PR

[Line 148 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY uom Price
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each $25.00

3Line 149

Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)

Name

MTF Equipment Sales

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

UomMm  Price

Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid

.-'.-'.-u-.-‘(_.)
-<

[Line 150

Travel time per hour (if any)

Name
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

QTY UoM Price
1 Hour $25.00
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|Line 151 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY UoM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Mile $0.50

|Line 152 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Percentage 10%

[Line 153

Hourly Rate for On-site repair per welding equipment repair.

Name

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Conroe Welding Supply, Inc.
American Industrial Supply

uoMm Price
Hour $50.00
Hour $90.00
Hour $145.00

»—\»—-»—-‘9
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[Line 154

Hourly Rate for In-shop per welding equipment repair.

Name

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Conroe Welding Supply, Inc.
American Industrial Supply

uoMm Price
Hour $50.00
Hour $75.00
Hour $100.00

»—\»—-»—-‘9
-<

|Line 155 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

American Industrial Supply
Conroe Welding Supply, Inc.

Each $65.00

1
1

|Line 156 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
American Industrial Supply
Conroe Welding Supply, Inc.

1 Each $25.00
1 Each $65.00
1 Each $0.00

|Line 157 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

American Industrial Supply
Conroe Welding Supply, Inc.

1 Each $12.00
1 Each $12.00

[Line 158

Travel time per hour (if any)

Name

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
American Industrial Supply
Conroe Welding Supply, Inc.

UuomM Price
Hour $25.00
Hour $65.00
Hour $0.00

»—\»—-»—-‘9
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|Line 159 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
American Industrial Supply
Conroe Welding Supply, Inc.

1 Mile $0.50
1 Mile $0.55
1 Mile $0.00

|Line 160 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

American Industrial Supply
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 10%

|Line 161 Hourly Rate for On-site per hydraulic floor jack equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $50.00

|Line 162 Hourly Rate for In-shop per hydraulic floor jack equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Hour $50.00
1 Hour $85.00

|Line 163 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

MTF Equipment Sales 1 Each $85.00

|Line 164 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

Each $25.00
Each $85.00

»—-»—-‘9
-<

|Line 165 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Each $25.00
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|Line 166 Travel time per hour (if any)
Name QTY UoM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Hour $25.00
1 Hour $85.00

|Line 167 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Mile $0.50
1 Mile $1.00

|Line 168 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
MTFE Equipment Sales

1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 0%

|Line 169 Hourly Rate for On-site per pedestal grinder equipment repair.
Name QTY UoOM  Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Hour $50.00

Circle Saw 1 Hour $95.00

|Line 170 Hourly Rate for In-shop per pedestal grinder equipment repair.
Name QTY UOM  Price

American Industrial Supply
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Hour $45.00
1 Hour $50.00
1

Circle Saw Hour $75.00

|Line 171 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY UoM Price

American Industrial Supply 1 Each $45.00

Circle Saw 1 Each $95.00

|Line 172 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY UoM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
American Industrial Supply

1 Each $25.00
1 Each $45.00
1

Circle Saw Each $95.00
|Line 173 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTY UoM Price
American Industrial Supply 1 Each $12.00
Circle Saw 1 Each $95.00
|Line 174 Travel time per hour (if any)
Name QTY UoM Price
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Hour $25.00
Circle Saw 1 Hour $95.00

1

American Industrial Supply

Hour $0.00

|Line 175 Mileage charge (if any)

Name QTY UuomM Price
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Mile $0.50
Circle Saw 1 Mile $0.00
American Industrial Supply 1 Mile $0.00

|Line 176 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

American Industrial Supply
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 10%

Circle Saw 1 Percentage 0%

|Line 177 Hourly Rate for On-site per angle grinder equipment repair.
Name QTY UOM  Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Hour $50.00

Circle Saw 1 Hour $95.00

|Line 178 Hourly Rate for In-shop per angle grinder equipment repair.
Name QTY UOM  Price

American Industrial Supply 1 Hour $45.00

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Hour $50.00

Circle Saw 1 Hour $75.00

|Line 179 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)

Name QTY UOM  Price

American Industrial Supply 1 Each $45.00

Circle Saw 1 Each $95.00
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|Line 180 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
American Industrial Supply
Circle Saw

Each $25.00
Each $45.00
Each $95.00

»—\»—-»—-‘9
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|Line 181 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

American Industrial Supply
Circle Saw

1 Each $12.00
1 Each $95.00

[Line 182

Travel time per hour (if any)

Name

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

American Industrial Supply

UuomM Price
Hour $25.00
Hour $95.00
Hour $0.00

»—\»—-»—-‘9
-<

|Line 183 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw
American Industrial Supply

1 Mile $0.50
1 Mile $0.00
1 Mile $0.00

|Line 184 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

American Industrial Supply
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 0%

|Line 185 Hourly Rate for On-site per router, CNC Patriot equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Hour $50.00
1 Hour $85.00

[Line 186

Hourly Rate for In-shop per router, CNC Patriot equipment repair.

Name
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

Teaching Systems, Inc

UoM Price
Hour $50.00
Hour $85.00

»—-»—-‘9
-<

[Line 187

Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)

Name
Teaching Systems, Inc (Alt 1)

QTY UoM Price
1 Each $0.00

|Line 188 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Teaching Systems, Inc

|Line 189 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Each $0.00

|Line 190 Travel time per hour (if any)
ame rice
N TY UoM Pri

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Hour $25.00
1 Hour $85.00

|Line 191 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Teaching Systems, Inc
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Mile $0.45
1 Mile $0.50

|Line 192 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 0%

[Line 193

Hourly Rate for On-site per tables, router and shaper equipment repair.

Name
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

Teaching Systems, Inc
Circle Saw

Hour $50.00
Hour $85.00
Hour $95.00

QTy  UOM  Price
1
1
1
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|Line 194 Hourly Rate for In-shop per tables, router and shaper equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Hour $50.00
1 Hour $75.00
1 Hour $85.00

ine stimate charge for repair costs (if any
Line 195 Esti h f i if
Name QTY UoM Price

Circle Saw Each $95.00

Teaching Systems, Inc

1
1

|Line 196 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Each $25.00
1 Each $95.00
1 Each $0.00

|Line 197 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTY UuomM Price

Circle Saw 1 Each $95.00
Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Each $0.00

|Line 198 Travel time per hour (if any)
Name QTY UuomM Price
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Hour $25.00
Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Hour $85.00
Circle Saw 1 Hour $95.00
|Line 199 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY UuomM Price

Teaching Systems, Inc
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

Circle Saw

1 Mile $0.45
1 Mile $0.50
1 Mile $0.00

|Line 200 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off
Circle Saw 1 Percentage 95%

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 0%

[Line 201

Hourly Rate for On-site per plasma cutting table, CNC Plasma Cam equipment repair.

Name
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

Teaching Systems, Inc

UoM Price
Hour $50.00
Hour $85.00

»—-»—-‘9
-<

|Line 202 Hourly Rate for In-shop per plasma cutting table, CNC Plasma Cam equipment repair.
Name QTY UoOM  Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Hour $50.00

Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Hour $85.00

|Line 203 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY UOM  Price

Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Each $0.00

|Line 204 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY UuomM Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services 1 Each $25.00

Teaching Systems, Inc 1 Each $0.00

Line 205 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any
ine 20 ick deli h if
Name QTY UoM Price

Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Each $0.00

|Line 206 Travel time per hour (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Hour $25.00

|Line 207 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Teaching Systems, Inc
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Mile $0.45
1 Mile $0.50
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|Line 208 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 0%

|Line 209 Hourly Rate for On-site per laser engraver, Helix Epilog equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Hour $50.00
1 Hour $85.00

|Line 210 Hourly Rate for In-shop per laser engraver, Helix Epilog equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Hour $50.00
1 Hour $85.00

|Line 211 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Each $0.00

|Line 212 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Teaching Systems, Inc
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Each $0.45
1 Each $25.00

|Line 213 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Each $0.00

|Line 214 Travel time per hour (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Hour $25.00
1 Hour $85.00

|Line 215 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Teaching Systems, Inc
Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services

1 Mile $0.45
1 Mile $0.50

|Line 216 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Teaching Systems, Inc

1 Percentage 10%
1 Percentage 0%

|Line 217 Hourly Rate for On-site per Bernina sewing machine or serger equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Sewing & Vacuum Warehouse

1 Hour $40.00

|Line 218 Hourly Rate for In-shop per Bernina sewing machine or serger equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Sewing & Vacuum Warehouse

1 Hour $40.00

|Line 219 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Sewing & Vacuum Warehouse

1 Each Varies

|Line 220 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Sewing & Vacuum Warehouse

1 Each $0.00

#Line 221

Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)

Name

MTF Equipment Sales

American Industrial Supply
Teaching Systems, Inc

Ramona Greer, DBA: Troy Services
Circle Saw

UOM  Price

Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid
Each No Bid

HHHHHB
-<

[Line 222 Travel time per hour (if any)
Name QTY UOM Price

Sewing & Vacuum Warehouse

1 Hour $0.00
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|Line 223 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY UoM Price

Sewing & Vacuum Warehouse

1 Mile $0.00

|Line 224 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

Sewing & Vacuum Warehouse

1 Percentage 25%

|Line 225 Hourly Rate for On-site per Janome sewing machine or serger equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Sewing & Vacuum Warehouse

1 Hour $40.00

[Line 226 Hourly Rate for In-shop per Janome sewing machine or serger equipment repair.
Name QTY uom Price

Sewing & Vacuum Warehouse

1 Hour $40.00

[Line 227 Estimate charge for repair costs (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Sewing & Vacuum Warehouse

1 Each Varies

|Line 228 Mininum charge per repair (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Sewing & Vacuum Warehouse

1 Each $0.00

|Line 229 Pick-up & delivery charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Sewing & Vacuum Warehouse

1 Each $0.00

|Line 230 Travel time per hour (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Sewing & Vacuum Warehouse

1 Hour $0.00

|Line 231 Mileage charge (if any)
Name QTY uom Price

Sewing & Vacuum Warehouse

1 Mile $0.00

|Line 232 % markup from manufacturer's list price for materials.
Name QTY uom Percent Off

Sewing & Vacuum Warehouse

1 Percentage 25%





