

18-06-5100R-RFP Carpet and Resilient Flooring

Service Descriptions	Commercial Flooring, Inc.	Floor-Tex Commercial Flooring, L.L.C.	Intex Flooring
Line Item 1	\$ 29.00	\$ 27.50	\$ 29.92
Line Item 2	\$ 63.00	\$ 56.00	\$ 58.86
Line Item 3	\$ 54.00	\$ 47.35	\$ 47.51
Line Item 4	\$ 5.00	\$ 2.95	\$ 2.50
Line Item 5	\$ 55.00	\$ 47.00	\$ 52.57
Line Item 6	\$ 6.50	\$ 3.95	\$ 3.95
Line Item 1	\$ 1.35	\$ 1.15	\$ 1.35
Line Item 2	\$ 1.35	\$ 2.40	\$ 1.35
Line Item 3	Discontinued	Discontinued	\$ 3.04
Line Item 4	Discontinued	Discontinued	\$ 3.04
Line Item 5	\$ 3.60	\$ 2.65	\$ 3.16
Line Item 6	Discontinued	Discontinued	No Bid
Line Item 7	\$ 5.00	\$ 3.85	\$ 4.20
Line Item 8	\$ 0.50	\$ 0.40	\$ 0.50
Line Item 9	\$ 55.00	\$ 47.00	\$ 52.57
Line Item 10	\$ 6.50	No Bid	\$ 0.58
Line Item 11	\$ 1.25	\$ 0.85	\$ 0.58
Line Item 12(a)	\$ 4.25	\$ 3.99	\$ 4.32
Line Item 12(b)	\$ 4.25	\$ 4.50	\$ 4.07
Line Item 12ca)	No Bid	\$ 3.05	\$ 3.68
Line Item 12(d)	No Bid	\$ 3.15	\$ 3.69
Line Item 12(e)	\$ 5.50	\$ 4.98	\$ 5.14
Line Item 12(f)	\$ 4.00	\$ 3.85	\$ 3.78
Line Item 13	\$ 0.50	\$ 0.35	\$ 0.50
Line Item 14	\$ 55.00	\$ 47.00	\$ 52.57
Line Item 15	\$ 1.50	\$ 1.25	\$ 1.00
Line Item 1	No Bid	\$ 5.65	No Bid
Line Item 2	No Bid	\$ 4.50	No Bid
Line Item 3	No Bid	\$ 0.60	No Bid
Line Item 4	No Bid	\$ 65.00	No Bid
Line Item 5	No Bid	\$ 18.00	No Bid
Line Item 1	\$ 1.10	\$ 1.10	\$ 1.14
Line Item 2	\$ 2.00	\$ 1.65	\$ 1.73
Line Item 3	\$ 4.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 2.42
Line Item 4	\$ 6.00	\$ 2.25	\$ 2.83
Line Item 1	\$ 9.00	\$ 8.05	\$ 7.65

Scoring Per Line-Item

Commercial Flooring, Inc.	Floor-Tex Commercial Flooring, L.L.C.	Intex Flooring
20.00	30.00	10.00
10.00	30.00	20.00
10.00	30.00	20.00
10.00	20.00	30.00
10.00	30.00	20.00
10.00	25.00	25.00
15.00	30.00	15.00
25.00	10.00	25.00
-	-	30.00
-	-	30.00
10.00	30.00	20.00
-	-	-
10.00	30.00	20.00
15.00	30.00	15.00
10.00	30.00	20.00
10.00	-	30.00
10.00	20.00	30.00
20.00	30.00	10.00
20.00	10.00	30.00
-	30.00	20.00
-	30.00	20.00
10.00	30.00	20.00
10.00	20.00	30.00
15.00	30.00	15.00
10.00	30.00	20.00
10.00	20.00	30.00
-	30.00	-
-	30.00	-
-	30.00	-
-	30.00	-
-	30.00	-
25.00	25.00	10.00
10.00	30.00	20.00
10.00	30.00	20.00
10.00	30.00	20.00
10.00	20.00	30.00

 Best Price
 Secondary Best Price